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COMPETITIVE SEALED PROPOSAL AND EVALUATION TABULATION
AUSTIN INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

CONTRACTS & PROCUREMENT

PROPOSAL OPENING FORM -19-0046-GROUP - 21CSP011 Replace Fire Control Panels District Wide

Big Opening Date: 08/04/2020

BID OPENING LOCATION: AISD Contracts and Procurement 4000 IH35 Frontage Rd. AustinTX, 78704

Base Proposal

Base Proposal

Base Proposal

Base Proposal

Base Proposal

Base Proposal

Total Proposal

Responsiveness

Offeror's Company Name Group 1 Group 2 Group 3 Group 4 Group 5 Group 6 Amount Yes/No
JM Electronic Engineering, Inc. $302,110.00 $281,920.00 $312,500.00 $252,020.00 $345,075.00 $331,375.00 $1,825,000.00 |Yes
All Campus Sequrity $330,984.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $330,984.76 Yes
Tri Star Commercial, LLC $159,722.86 $183,758.00 $185,320.00 $189,197.14 $255,978.57 $235,272.85 $1,209,249.42 |No
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